BID RESUME

District: Oxnard Union High School District
Project: Relocatable Buildings Sitework

Bid Package #: 615

Bid Type: __ X Formal

Bid Advertisement:
Mandatory Job Walk:
Bids Due Date:
Addenda Issued: 0
Bid Opening Location:

CUPCCA __X Pre-qualified

2/23/20 & 3/1/20
3/2/20 @ 9am @ ACHS
3/16/20 @ 2pm

Purchasing Department, Building G

Addendum (A)

General Contractor

Received

Base Bid/Alternates

1(2|3]4|5]|6

Name, Address and Phone Number

Ardalan Construction Company Bid Bond X (4) ACHS $641,000.00
8 E. Gainsborough Road __ CIHS $634,000.00
Thousand Oaks, CA 91360 Cashier’s Check HHS $926,000.00
Cash RCHS $910,000.00
MVC Enterprises, Inc. Bid Bond X (4) ACHS $549,000.00
27250 Via Industria __ CIHS $497,000.00
Temecula, CA 92590 Cashier’s Check HHS $798,000.00
Cash RCHS $859,000.00
Ohno Construction Company Bid Bond (1) ACHS $710,000.00
16398 Boyle Avenue < Check CIHS - No Bid
Fontana, CA 92337 Cashier’s Chec HHS $1,120,000.00
Cash RCHS - No Bid
R Brothers, Inc. Bid Bond X (4) ACHS $1,200,000.00
702 Celis Street - CIHS $1,900,000.00
San Fernando, CA 91340 Cashier’s Check HHS $1,900.000.00
Cash RCHS $2,700,000.00
SBS Corporation Bid Bond X (4) ACHS $599,964.00
2409 Avenida de la Rosa __ CIHS $476,289.00
Camarillo, CA 93010 Cashier’s Check HHS $987,845.00
Cash RCHS $1,228,816.00
Viola, Inc. Bid Bond X (1) ACHS - No Bid
PO Box 5624 — CIHS - No Bid
Oxnard, CA 93031 Cashier’s Check HHS - No Bid
Cash RCHS $921,000.00
Waisman Construction, Inc. Bid Bond X (4) ACHS $577,000.00
21430 Strathern Street —
Canoga Park, CA 91304 Cashier’s Check E,:_I;ISSSB%%Z&)%%O@%O
Cash RCHS $879,000.00

Cash




	Name, Address and Phone Number

